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R. vcharenko. Legislative Support Diversity of Owner Ship in Ukraine And Place it in
The National Company

It is proved in the article that the innovative people enterprise is an organizational and legal
form which differs from existing now in Ukraine and have common features with full society and
the enterprises of collective form of ownership. From the legal point of view the concept “national
innovative enterprise” most closely corresponds the legal form “national enterprise” which is
officially existing in the Russian Federation. Despite similarity of this models it is not identical and
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borrowed as the formation reasons, the principles of creation of the enterprise and the modes of
functioning have essential differences.The concept of “the national innovative enterprise” differs
from other interconnected legal forms on the following signs. Branch aspect – the national
innovative enterprise is created in branches of the 5th and 6th technological levels and is
innovative by a main type of the activity. It doesn’t exclude possibility of application of this
organizational and legal form to the enterprises of the 3rd and 4th levels, however it will demand a
specification of forms of participation of workers in decision-making.In general, the following
principle is observed: than more creative is activity in general, especially the “innovative national
enterprise” form is adequate. Thus efficiency of this form will be higher among the enterprises of
one technological level that is caused by the property right of the worker to means of production
exercised in it. Economic aspect – the enterprise is in the first phase of life cycle called “rise”
(according to I. Adizes model). Legal aspect: the state (in the form of the central, regional and
local authorities) may be an equal owner of the enterprise that is defined by need of control of
innovative development in some cases, control from local authorities – if the enterprise is “growth
point” in the territory or has a status of the city-forming enterprise. An aspect of distribution of
property: the applicant who is answering to professional criteria and brought the financial capital in
the sum adequate to a post according to classification of positions can become the participant of
the enterprise; at dismissal from the enterprise the worker receives a financial equivalent of cost,
reserving the right of possession it in any forms. An aspect of management: depending on the size
of the enterprise (patient or explerent firm) control can be performed as by self-government (as
cooperative) and by delegation of powers to governing bodies (as joint-stock company).

Key words: ownership, business, law, security, national enterprise.


